
 
Explanatory note for Information Disclosures1 
 
Background 
 
The Information Disclosures set out in this public disclosure pursuant to the 
Electricity Distribution (Information Disclosure) Requirements 2008, represent 
Vector’s first set of disclosures under the new information disclosure regime.  The 
new requirements prescribe the way the information disclosure is presented by 
mandating the use of templates that are issued by the Commission. The purpose of 
this note is to explain the key differences between disclosures under the new 
requirements compared with the old requirements. 
 
Changes in Determining Return on Investment (ROI) 
 
The new requirements incorporate two key changes to the calculation of Return on 
Investment (ROI).  The first key change relates to an allowance for revaluation gains 
due to the effect of CPI inflation applied to the Regulated Asset Base (RAB).  Of the 
total reported return in 2008, CPI inflation contributed around 3.1 percentage points.  
 
The second key change is that the calculation of regulatory tax is determined strictly 
in accordance with the Commerce Commission template which produces an 
estimated tax payable (cash tax) number. Previously accounting tax expense was 
used for ROI calculation purposes. This change has added a further 1.3% 
(approximately) to Vector’s reported ROI for 2008.  
 
Stability of ROI in the future 
 
The ROI reported for 2008 is not necessarily a good predictor of future ROI as 
Vector’s circumstances have changed since 31 March 2008, the ROI methodology 
incorporates inherent volatility and the information disclosure regime overall is 
subject to ongoing development and change. 
 
Key post balance date development 
 
On 24 July 2008, Vector sold its Wellington network.  These information disclosure 
statements (for the year ended 31 March 2008) consolidate the performance of 
Vector’s Auckland electricity networks with the Wellington network and therefore the 
results are not indicative of Vector’s financial and operating performance in future.   
 

                                                 
1 Please note that this explanatory note does not form part of the audited information disclosures set out 
below. 



 
Inherent volatility due to ROI methodology 
 
Compared to previously reported information disclosure statements, Vector expects 
reported ROIs to be more volatile, because the calculation now adds in an allowance 
for revaluation gains due to the effect of applying CPI inflation to the Regulated 
Asset Base.  While this contributed 3.1 percentage points to Vector’s reported ROI 
for 2008, the Reserve Bank’s CPI forecasts in the March 2009 Monetary Policy 
Statement are for CPI to fall to 1.6% by 31 March 2010 (a 1.8% decrease from the 
CPI in the 31 March 2008 year). 
 
Regime is subject to ongoing change 
 
Although the new requirements cover all aspects of the information disclosure 
regime, the Commission has indicated that a number of final decisions on some 
aspects of the information disclosure regime will be made, following further 
consultation.  There are also parts of the new requirements where interpretation is 
required, therefore we expect there will be further revisions to the requirements in 
the future, including revisions as a result of changes required by the Commerce 
Amendment Act 2008. In particular, the methodologies that are implicit in the 
current Information Disclosure Regulations will be subject to review (including 
through the Courts) and may change. The Commerce Commission is obliged to 
publish input methodologies by 30 June 2010, or 30 December 2010 if an extension 
is agreed to by the Minister of Commerce.  
 
Other key change 
 
Reporting of “Distribution Transformer Capacity (non-Electricity Distribution Business 
(EDB) owned)” is a new requirement for information disclosure.  The corresponding 
definitions have changed significantly with previous returns. In previous returns, 
zone substation capacity for some major customers has been included. Following the 
revised definitions they have now been excluded.  Previous returns have also 
included voltage regulating transformers and auto transformers, which in this 
context are not considered distribution transformers. 
 
For comparison, last year’s disclosure for Vector overall was 5,121 MVA, but this 
counted only EDB-owned transformers with the above amendments.  The EDB-
owned component of this year’s return was 5,086 MVA. The lower value reflects the 
change in definitions between old disclosure and new disclosure requirements and 
does not represent a reduction in transformer capacity. 
 



 
Further information available 
 
Further information on the changes to the information disclosure regulations is 
available on the Commerce Commission’s website at: 
 
http://www.comcom.govt.nz/IndustryRegulation/Electricity/ElectricityInformationDis
closure/currentrequirements.aspx 












































































